
The McLaughlin & Harvey undergraduate 
placement will give you the opportunity to train 
in your chosen career path. From day one, our 
placement is designed to give you relevant and 
practical experience, tailored to suit your chosen 
career. Join McLaughlin & Harvey and you will 
gain invaluable hands on experience, ready to 
begin your career in one of the most exciting 
industries around!

We o�er a paid placement with the opportunity 
to progress onto the graduate scheme following 
your graduation. Training will include time in 
relevant departments o�ering a broader 
understanding of how the business operates by 
getting involved in interesting and challenging 
work.

UNDERGRADUATE
PLACEMENT

Our undergraduate placement focuses on 
developing your skills both professionally and 
interpersonally. The placement is structured, and 
you will experience working with other 
departments to broaden your knowledge of how 
the business operates.
What is exciting about this opportunity is that 
you will be putting into practice what you have 
learned so far at university by working with 
experienced colleagues on a range of 
high-profile projects. You will get responsibility 
from an early stage in your career and will play a 
key role in helping deliver projects on time and on 
budget.

 

COMPETITIVE
SALARY

DURATION

PRACTICAL
EXPERIENCE

INDUSTRY
NETWORKING

UP TO 12
MONTHS

To learn more about our current opportunities: 

CLICK HERE

https://www.mclh.co.uk/careers/job-opportunities/

